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The number of shares of common stock, $.0001 par value, outstanding as of February 13, 2014 was 30,911,906.
DOCUMENTS INCORPORATED BY REFERENCE
Portions of the Registrant’s Proxy Statement for the 2014 Annual Meeting of Stockholders are incorporated by
reference into Part III.
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PART I

ITEM 1.  BUSINESS.

Organization
EastGroup Properties, Inc. (the Company or EastGroup) is an equity real estate investment trust (REIT) organized in
1969.  The Company has elected to be taxed and intends to continue to qualify as a REIT under Sections 856-860 of
the Internal Revenue Code (the Code), as amended.

Available Information
The Company maintains a website at eastgroup.net.  The Company posts its annual reports on Form 10-K, quarterly
reports on Form 10-Q, current reports on Form 8-K and amendments to those reports filed or furnished pursuant to
Section 13(a) of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934, as amended, as soon as reasonably practicable after it
electronically files or furnishes such materials to the Securities and Exchange Commission (SEC).  In addition, the
Company's website includes items related to corporate governance matters, including, among other things, the
Company's corporate governance guidelines, charters of various committees of the Board of Directors, and the
Company's code of business conduct and ethics applicable to all employees, officers and directors.  The Company
intends to disclose on its website any amendment to, or waiver of, any provision of this code of business conduct and
ethics applicable to the Company's directors and executive officers that would otherwise be required to be disclosed
under the rules of the SEC or the New York Stock Exchange.  Copies of these reports and corporate governance
documents may be obtained, free of charge, from the Company's website.  Any shareholder also may obtain copies of
these documents, free of charge, by sending a request in writing to: Investor Relations, EastGroup Properties, Inc., 190
East Capitol Street, Suite 400, Jackson, MS 39201-2152.

Administration
EastGroup maintains its principal executive office and headquarters in Jackson, Mississippi.  The Company also has
regional offices in Orlando, Houston and Phoenix and asset management offices in Charlotte and Dallas.  EastGroup
has property management offices in Jacksonville, Tampa, Fort Lauderdale and San Antonio.  Offices at these locations
allow the Company to provide property management services to all of its Florida, Texas (except El Paso), Arizona,
Mississippi and North Carolina properties, which together account for 79% of the Company’s total portfolio on a
square foot basis.  In addition, the Company currently provides property administration (accounting of operations) for
its entire portfolio.  The regional offices in Florida, Texas and Arizona provide oversight of the Company's
development program.  As of February 13, 2014, EastGroup had 70 full-time employees and 3 part-time employees.

Operations
EastGroup is focused on the development, acquisition and operation of industrial properties in major Sunbelt markets
throughout the United States with an emphasis in the states of Florida, Texas, Arizona, California and North
Carolina.  The Company’s goal is to maximize shareholder value by being a leading provider of functional, flexible
and quality business distribution space for location sensitive tenants primarily in the 5,000 to 50,000 square foot
range.  EastGroup’s strategy for growth is based on the ownership of premier distribution facilities generally clustered
near major transportation features in supply constrained submarkets.  Over 99% of the Company’s revenue consists
of rental income from real estate properties.

During 2013, EastGroup increased its holdings in real estate properties through its acquisition and development
programs.  The Company purchased two warehouse distribution complexes (837,000 square feet) and 50.9 acres of
development land for a total of $79.0 million.  Also during 2013, the Company began construction of 13 development
projects containing 1,177,000 square feet and transferred 14 properties (1,025,000 square feet) from its development
program to real estate properties with costs of $69.9 million at the date of transfer.   
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EastGroup incurs short-term floating rate bank debt in connection with the acquisition and development of real estate
and, as market conditions permit, replaces floating rate debt with equity and/or fixed-rate debt. In March 2013,
Moody's Investor Services announced the Company's issuer rating of Baa2, and in December 2013, Fitch affirmed the
Company's credit rating of BBB. A security rating is not a recommendation to buy, sell, or hold securities and may be
subject to revision or withdrawal at any time by the assigning rating agency. Each rating should be evaluated
independently of any other rating. The Company intends to obtain primarily unsecured fixed rate debt in the future.
The Company may also access the public debt market in the future as a means to raise capital.

EastGroup holds its properties as long-term investments but may determine to sell certain properties that no longer
meet its investment criteria.  The Company may provide financing in connection with such sales of property if market
conditions require.  In addition, the Company may provide financing to a partner or co-owner in connection with an
acquisition of real estate in certain situations.

4
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Subject to the requirements necessary to maintain EastGroup’s qualifications as a REIT, the Company may acquire
securities of entities engaged in real estate activities or securities of other issuers, including for the purpose of
exercising control over those entities.

The Company intends to continue to qualify as a REIT under the Code.  To maintain its status as a REIT, the
Company is required to distribute at least 90% of its ordinary taxable income to its stockholders.  If the Company has
a capital gain, it has the option of (i) deferring recognition of the capital gain through a tax-deferred exchange, (ii)
declaring and paying a capital gain dividend on any recognized net capital gain resulting in no corporate level tax, or
(iii) retaining and paying corporate income tax on its net long-term capital gain, with shareholders reporting their
proportional share of the undistributed long-term capital gain and receiving a credit or refund of their share of the tax
paid by the Company.

EastGroup has no present intention of acting as an underwriter of offerings of securities of other issuers.  The
strategies and policies set forth above were determined and are subject to review by EastGroup's Board of Directors,
which may change such strategies or policies based upon its evaluation of the state of the real estate market, the
performance of EastGroup's assets, capital and credit market conditions, and other relevant factors.  EastGroup
provides annual reports to its stockholders, which contain financial statements audited by the Company’s independent
registered public accounting firm.

Environmental Matters
Under various federal, state and local laws, ordinances and regulations, an owner of real estate may be liable for the
costs of removal or remediation of certain hazardous or toxic substances on or in such property.  Many such laws
impose liability without regard to whether the owner knows of, or was responsible for, the presence of such hazardous
or toxic substances.  The presence of such substances, or the failure to properly remediate such substances, may
adversely affect the owner’s ability to sell or rent such property or to use such property as collateral in its
borrowings.  EastGroup’s properties have been subjected to Phase I Environmental Site Assessments (ESAs) by
independent environmental consultants and as necessary, have been subjected to Phase II ESAs.  These reports have
not revealed any potential significant environmental liability.  Management of EastGroup is not aware of any
environmental liability that would have a material adverse effect on EastGroup’s business, assets, financial position or
results of operations.

ITEM 1A.  RISK FACTORS.

In addition to the other information contained or incorporated by reference in this document, readers should carefully
consider the following risk factors.  Any of these risks or the occurrence of any one or more of the uncertainties
described below could have a material adverse effect on the Company's financial condition and the performance of its
business.  The Company refers to itself as "we", "us" or "our" in the following risk factors.

Real Estate Industry Risks
We face risks associated with local real estate conditions in areas where we own properties.  We may be adversely
affected by general economic conditions and local real estate conditions.  For example, an oversupply of industrial
properties in a local area or a decline in the attractiveness of our properties to tenants would have a negative effect on
us.  Other factors that may affect general economic conditions or local real estate conditions include:

•population and demographic trends;
•employment and personal income trends;
•income and other tax laws;
•changes in interest rates and availability and costs of financing;
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•increased operating costs, including insurance premiums, utilities and real estate taxes, due to inflation and otherfactors which may not necessarily be offset by increased rents; and
•construction costs.

We may be unable to compete for properties and tenants.  The real estate business is highly competitive.  We compete
for interests in properties with other real estate investors and purchasers, some of whom have greater financial
resources, revenues and geographical diversity than we have.  Furthermore, we compete for tenants with other
property owners.  All of our industrial properties are subject to significant local competition.  We also compete with a
wide variety of institutions and other investors for capital funds necessary to support our investment activities and
asset growth.

We are subject to significant regulation that constrains our activities.  Local zoning and land use laws, environmental
statutes and other governmental requirements restrict our expansion, rehabilitation and reconstruction
activities.  These regulations may prevent us from taking advantage of economic opportunities.  Legislation such as
the Americans with Disabilities Act may require us to

5
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modify our properties, and noncompliance could result in the imposition of fines or an award of damages to private
litigants.  Future legislation may impose additional requirements.  We cannot predict what requirements may be
enacted or what changes may be implemented to existing legislation.

Risks Associated with Our Properties
We may be unable to lease space.  When a lease expires, a tenant may elect not to renew it.  We may not be able to
re-lease the property on similar terms, if we are able to re-lease the property at all.  The terms of renewal or re-lease
(including the cost of required renovations and/or concessions to tenants) may be less favorable to us than the prior
lease.  We also develop some properties with no pre-leasing.  If we are unable to lease all or a substantial portion of
our properties, or if the rental rates upon such leasing are significantly lower than expected rates, our cash generated
before debt repayments and capital expenditures and our ability to make expected distributions to stockholders may be
adversely affected.

We have been and may continue to be affected negatively by tenant bankruptcies and leasing delays.  At any time, a
tenant may experience a downturn in its business that may weaken its financial condition.  Similarly, a general decline
in the economy may result in a decline in the demand for space at our industrial properties.  As a result, our tenants
may delay lease commencement, fail to make rental payments when due, or declare bankruptcy.  Any such event
could result in the termination of that tenant’s lease and losses to us, and distributions to investors may decrease.  We
receive a substantial portion of our income as rents under mid-term and long-term leases.  If tenants are unable to
comply with the terms of their leases because of rising costs or falling sales, we may deem it advisable to modify lease
terms to allow tenants to pay a lower rent or a smaller share of taxes, insurance and other operating costs.  If a tenant
becomes insolvent or bankrupt, we cannot be sure that we could recover the premises from the tenant promptly or
from a trustee or debtor-in-possession in any bankruptcy proceeding relating to the tenant.  We also cannot be sure
that we would receive rent in the proceeding sufficient to cover our expenses with respect to the premises.  If a tenant
becomes bankrupt, the federal bankruptcy code will apply and, in some instances, may restrict the amount and
recoverability of our claims against the tenant.  A tenant’s default on its obligations to us could adversely affect our
financial condition and the cash we have available for distribution.

We face risks associated with our property development.  We intend to continue to develop properties where market
conditions warrant such investment.  Once made, our investments may not produce results in accordance with our
expectations.  Risks associated with our current and future development and construction activities include:

•the availability of favorable financing alternatives;

•the risk that we may not be able to obtain land on which to develop or that due to the increased cost of land, ouractivities may not be as profitable;

•construction costs exceeding original estimates due to rising interest rates and increases in the costs of materials andlabor;
•construction and lease-up delays resulting in increased debt service, fixed expenses and construction costs;
•expenditure of funds and devotion of management's time to projects that we do not complete;

•
fluctuations of occupancy and rental rates at newly completed properties, which depend on a number of factors,
including market and economic conditions, resulting in lower than projected rental rates and a corresponding lower
return on our investment; and

•complications (including building moratoriums and anti-growth legislation) in obtaining necessary zoning, occupancyand other governmental permits.

We face risks associated with property acquisitions.  We acquire individual properties and portfolios of properties and
intend to continue to do so.  Our acquisition activities and their success are subject to the following risks:

•
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when we are able to locate a desired property, competition from other real estate investors may significantly increase
the purchase price;
•acquired properties may fail to perform as expected;
•the actual costs of repositioning or redeveloping acquired properties may be higher than our estimates;

•
acquired properties may be located in new markets where we face risks associated with an incomplete knowledge or
understanding of the local market, a limited number of established business relationships in the area and a relative
unfamiliarity with local governmental and permitting procedures;

•
we may be unable to quickly and efficiently integrate new acquisitions, particularly acquisitions of portfolios of
properties, into our existing operations, and as a result, our results of operations and financial condition could be
adversely affected; and

•
we may acquire properties subject to liabilities and without any recourse, or with only limited recourse, to the
transferor with respect to unknown liabilities. As a result, if a claim were asserted against us based upon ownership of
those properties, we might have to pay substantial sums to settle it, which could adversely affect our cash flow.

6
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Coverage under our existing insurance policies may be inadequate to cover losses.  We generally maintain insurance
policies related to our business, including casualty, general liability and other policies, covering our business
operations, employees and assets as appropriate for the markets where our properties and business operations are
located.  However, we would be required to bear all losses that are not adequately covered by insurance.  In addition,
there may be certain losses that are not generally insured against or that are not generally fully insured against because
it is not deemed economically feasible or prudent to do so, including losses due to floods, wind, earthquakes, acts of
war, acts of terrorism or riots.  If an uninsured loss or a loss in excess of insured limits occurs with respect to one or
more of our properties, then we could lose the capital we invested in the properties, as well as the anticipated future
revenue from the properties.  In addition, if the damaged properties are subject to recourse indebtedness, we would
continue to be liable for the indebtedness, even if these properties were irreparably damaged.

We face risks due to lack of geographic and real estate sector diversity.  Substantially all of our properties are located
in the Sunbelt region of the United States with an emphasis in the states of Florida, Texas, Arizona, California and
North Carolina.  A downturn in general economic conditions and local real estate conditions in these geographic
regions, as a result of oversupply of or reduced demand for industrial properties, local business climate, business
layoffs and changing demographics, would have a particularly strong adverse effect on us.  Our investments in real
estate assets are concentrated in the industrial distribution sector.  This concentration may expose us to the risk of
economic downturns in this sector to a greater extent than if our business activities included other sectors of the real
estate industry.

We face risks due to the illiquidity of real estate which may limit our ability to vary our portfolio.  Real estate
investments are relatively illiquid.  Our ability to vary our portfolio in response to changes in economic and other
conditions will therefore be limited.  In addition, because of our status as a REIT, the Internal Revenue Code limits
our ability to sell our properties.  If we must sell an investment, we cannot ensure that we will be able to dispose of the
investment on terms favorable to the Company.

We are subject to environmental laws and regulations.  Current and previous real estate owners and operators may be
required under various federal, state and local laws, ordinances and regulations to investigate and clean up hazardous
substances released at the properties they own or operate.  They may also be liable to the government or to third
parties for substantial property or natural resource damage, investigation costs and cleanup costs.  Such laws often
impose liability without regard to whether the owner or operator knew of, or was responsible for, the release or
presence of such hazardous substances.  In addition, some environmental laws create a lien on the contaminated site in
favor of the government for damages and costs the government incurs in connection with the
contamination.  Contamination may adversely affect the owner’s ability to use, sell or lease real estate or to borrow
using the real estate as collateral.  We have no way of determining at this time the magnitude of any potential liability
to which we may be subject arising out of environmental conditions or violations with respect to the properties we
currently or formerly owned.  Environmental laws today can impose liability on a previous owner or operator of a
property that owned or operated the property at a time when hazardous or toxic substances were disposed of, released
from, or present at the property.  A conveyance of the property, therefore, may not relieve the owner or operator from
liability.  Although ESAs have been conducted at our properties to identify potential sources of contamination at the
properties, such ESAs do not reveal all environmental liabilities or compliance concerns that could arise from the
properties.  Moreover, material environmental liabilities or compliance concerns may exist, of which we are currently
unaware, that in the future may have a material adverse effect on our business, assets or results of operations.

Compliance with new laws or regulations related to climate change, including compliance with “green” building codes,
may require us to make improvements to our existing properties.  Proposed legislation could also increase the costs of
energy and utilities.  The cost of the proposed legislation may adversely affect our financial position, results of
operations and cash flows.  We may be adversely affected by floods, hurricanes and other climate related events.
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Financing Risks
We face risks associated with the use of debt to fund acquisitions and developments, including refinancing risk.  We
are subject to the risks normally associated with debt financing, including the risk that our cash flow will be
insufficient to meet required payments of principal and interest.  In addition, certain of our mortgages will have
significant outstanding principal balances on their maturity dates, commonly known as “balloon payments.”  Therefore,
we will likely need to refinance at least a portion of our outstanding debt as it matures.  There is a risk that we may not
be able to refinance existing debt or that the terms of any refinancing will not be as favorable as the terms of the
existing debt.

We face risks associated with our dependence on external sources of capital.  In order to qualify as a REIT, we are
required each year to distribute to our stockholders at least 90% of our ordinary taxable income, and we are subject to
tax on our income to the extent it is not distributed.  Because of this distribution requirement, we may not be able to
fund all future capital needs from cash retained from operations.  As a result, to fund capital needs, we rely on
third-party sources of capital, which we may not be able to obtain on favorable terms, if at all.  Our access to
third-party sources of capital depends upon a number of factors, including

7

Edgar Filing: EASTGROUP PROPERTIES INC - Form 10-K

12



(i) general market conditions; (ii) the market’s perception of our growth potential; (iii) our current and potential future
earnings and cash distributions; and (iv) the market price of our capital stock.  Additional debt financing may
substantially increase our debt-to-total market capitalization ratio.  Additional equity financing may dilute the
holdings of our current stockholders.

Covenants in our credit agreements could limit our flexibility and adversely affect our financial condition.  The terms
of our various credit agreements and other indebtedness require us to comply with a number of customary financial
and other covenants, such as maintaining debt service coverage and leverage ratios and maintaining insurance
coverage.  These covenants may limit our flexibility in our operations, and breaches of these covenants could result in
defaults under the instruments governing the applicable indebtedness even if we had satisfied our payment
obligations.  If we are unable to refinance our indebtedness at maturity or meet our payment obligations, the amount
of our distributable cash flow and our financial condition would be adversely affected.

Adverse changes in our credit ratings could impair our ability to obtain additional debt and equity financing on
favorable terms, if at all. Our credit ratings are based on our operating performance, liquidity and leverage ratios,
overall financial position and other factors employed by the credit rating agencies in their rating analysis of us. Our
credit ratings can affect the amount and type of capital we can access, as well as the terms of any financings we may
obtain. There can be no assurance that we will be able to maintain our current credit ratings. In the event our current
credit ratings deteriorate, it may be more difficult or expensive to obtain additional financing or refinance existing
obligations and commitments. Also, a downgrade in our credit ratings would trigger additional costs or other
potentially negative consequences under our current and future credit facilities and debt instruments.

Increases in interest rates would increase our interest expense. At December 31, 2013, we had $89.0 million of
variable rate debt outstanding not protected by interest rate hedge contracts. We may incur additional variable rate
debt in the future. If interest rates increase, then so would the interest expense on our unhedged variable rate debt,
which would adversely affect our financial condition and results of operations. From time to time, we manage our
exposure to interest rate risk with interest rate hedge contracts that effectively fix or cap a portion of our variable rate
debt. In addition, we refinance fixed rate debt at times when we believe rates and terms are appropriate. Our efforts to
manage these exposures may not be successful. Our use of interest rate hedge contracts to manage risk associated with
interest rate volatility may expose us to additional risks, including a risk that a counterparty to a hedge contract may
fail to honor its obligations. Developing an effective interest rate risk strategy is complex and no strategy can
completely insulate us from risks associated with interest rate fluctuations. There can be no assurance that our hedging
activities will have the desired beneficial impact on our results of operations or financial condition. Termination of
interest rate hedge contracts typically involves costs, such as transaction fees or breakage costs.

A lack of any limitation on our debt could result in our becoming more highly leveraged.  Our governing documents
do not limit the amount of indebtedness we may incur.  Accordingly, our Board of Directors may incur additional debt
and would do so, for example, if it were necessary to maintain our status as a REIT.  We might become more highly
leveraged as a result, and our financial condition and cash available for distribution to stockholders might be
negatively affected and the risk of default on our indebtedness could increase.

Other Risks
The market value of our common stock could decrease based on our performance and market perception and
conditions.  The market value of our common stock may be based primarily upon the market’s perception of our
growth potential and current and future cash dividends and may be secondarily based upon the real estate market value
of our underlying assets.  The market price of our common stock is influenced by the dividend on our common stock
relative to market interest rates.  Rising interest rates may lead potential buyers of our common stock to expect a
higher dividend rate, which would adversely affect the market price of our common stock.  In addition, rising interest
rates would result in increased expense, thereby adversely affecting cash flow and our ability to service our
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indebtedness and pay dividends.

The state of the economy or other adverse changes in general or local economic conditions may adversely affect our
operating results and financial condition.  Turmoil in the global financial markets may have an adverse impact on the
availability of credit to businesses generally and could lead to a further weakening of the U.S. and global
economies.  Currently these conditions have not impaired our ability to access credit markets and finance our
operations.  However, our ability to access the capital markets may be restricted at a time when we would like, or
need, to raise financing, which could have an impact on our flexibility to react to changing economic and business
conditions.  Furthermore, deteriorating economic conditions including business layoffs, downsizing, industry
slowdowns and other similar factors that affect our customers could continue to negatively impact commercial real
estate fundamentals and result in lower occupancy, lower rental rates and declining values in our real estate portfolio
and in the collateral securing any loan investments we may make.  Additionally, an adverse economic situation could
have an impact on our lenders or customers, causing them to fail to meet their obligations to us.  No assurances can be
given that the effects of an adverse economic situation will not have a material adverse effect on our business,
financial condition and results of operations.

8

Edgar Filing: EASTGROUP PROPERTIES INC - Form 10-K

14



We may fail to qualify as a REIT.  If we fail to qualify as a REIT, we will not be allowed to deduct distributions to
stockholders in computing our taxable income and will be subject to federal income tax, including any applicable
alternative minimum tax, at regular corporate rates.  In addition, we may be barred from qualification as a REIT for
the four years following disqualification.  The additional tax incurred at regular corporate rates would significantly
reduce the cash flow available for distribution to stockholders and for debt service.  Furthermore, we would no longer
be required by the Internal Revenue Code to make any distributions to our stockholders as a condition of REIT
qualification.  Any distributions to stockholders would be taxable as ordinary income to the extent of our current and
accumulated earnings and profits. Corporate distributees, however, may be eligible for the dividends received
deduction on the distributions, subject to limitations under the Internal Revenue Code.  To qualify as a REIT, we must
comply with certain highly technical and complex requirements.  We cannot be certain we have complied with these
requirements because there are few judicial and administrative interpretations of these provisions.  In addition, facts
and circumstances that may be beyond our control may affect our ability to qualify as a REIT.  We cannot assure you
that new legislation, regulations, administrative interpretations or court decisions will not change the tax laws
significantly with respect to our qualification as a REIT or with respect to the federal income tax consequences of
qualification.  We cannot assure you that we will remain qualified as a REIT.

There is a risk of changes in the tax law applicable to real estate investment trusts.  Since the Internal Revenue
Service, the United States Treasury Department and Congress frequently review federal income tax legislation, we
cannot predict whether, when or to what extent new federal tax laws, regulations, interpretations or rulings will be
adopted.  Any such legislative action may prospectively or retroactively modify our tax treatment and, therefore, may
adversely affect taxation of us and/or our investors.

We face possible adverse changes in tax laws.  From time to time, changes in state and local tax laws or regulations
are enacted which may result in an increase in our tax liability. A shortfall in tax revenues for states and municipalities
in which we operate may lead to an increase in the frequency and size of such changes. If such changes occur, we may
be required to pay additional taxes on our assets or income. These increased tax costs could adversely affect our
financial condition, results of operations and the amount of cash available for the payment of dividends.

Our Charter contains provisions that may adversely affect the value of EastGroup stock.  Our charter prohibits any
holder from acquiring more than 9.8% (in value or in number, whichever is more restrictive) of our outstanding equity
stock (defined as all of our classes of capital stock, except our excess stock (of which there is none outstanding))
unless our Board of Directors grants a waiver.  The ownership limit may limit the opportunity for stockholders to
receive a premium for their shares of common stock that might otherwise exist if an investor were attempting to
assemble a block of shares in excess of 9.8% of the outstanding shares of equity stock or otherwise effect a change in
control.  Also, the request of the holders of a majority or more of our common stock is necessary for stockholders to
call a special meeting.  We also require advance notice by stockholders for the nomination of directors or the proposal
of business to be considered at a meeting of stockholders.

The Company faces risks in attracting and retaining key personnel.  Many of our senior executives have strong
industry reputations, which aid us in identifying acquisition and development opportunities and negotiating with
tenants and sellers of properties.  The loss of the services of these key personnel could affect our operations because of
diminished relationships with existing and prospective tenants, property sellers and industry personnel.  In addition,
attracting new or replacement personnel may be difficult in a competitive market.

We have severance and change in control agreements with certain of our officers that may deter changes in control of
the Company.  If, within a certain time period (as set in the officer’s agreement) following a change in control, we
terminate the officer's employment other than for cause, or if the officer elects to terminate his or her employment
with us for reasons specified in the agreement, we will make a severance payment equal to the officer's average annual
compensation times an amount specified in the officer's agreement, together with the officer's base salary and vacation
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pay that have accrued but are unpaid through the date of termination.  These agreements may deter a change in control
because of the increased cost for a third party to acquire control of us.

Our Board of Directors may authorize and issue securities without stockholder approval.  Under our Charter, the
Board has the power to classify and reclassify any of our unissued shares of capital stock into shares of capital stock
with such preferences, rights, powers and restrictions as the Board of Directors may determine.  The authorization and
issuance of a new class of capital stock could have the effect of delaying or preventing someone from taking control of
us, even if a change in control were in our stockholders' best interests.

Maryland business statutes may limit the ability of a third party to acquire control of us.  Maryland law provides
protection for Maryland corporations against unsolicited takeovers by limiting, among other things, the duties of the
directors in unsolicited takeover situations.  The duties of directors of Maryland corporations do not require them to
(a) accept, recommend or respond to any proposal by a person seeking to acquire control of the corporation, (b)
authorize the corporation to redeem any rights under,

9
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or modify or render inapplicable, any stockholders rights plan, (c) make a determination under the Maryland Business
Combination Act or the Maryland Control Share Acquisition Act, or (d) act or fail to act solely because of the effect
of the act or failure to act may have on an acquisition or potential acquisition of control of the corporation or the
amount or type of consideration that may be offered or paid to the stockholders in an acquisition.  Moreover, under
Maryland law the act of a director of a Maryland corporation relating to or affecting an acquisition or potential
acquisition of control is not subject to any higher duty or greater scrutiny than is applied to any other act of a
director.  Maryland law also contains a statutory presumption that an act of a director of a Maryland corporation
satisfies the applicable standards of conduct for directors under Maryland law.

The Maryland Business Combination Act provides that unless exempted, a Maryland corporation may not engage in
business combinations, including mergers, dispositions of 10 percent or more of its assets, certain issuances of shares
of stock and other specified transactions, with an "interested stockholder" or an affiliate of an interested stockholder
for five years after the most recent date on which the interested stockholder became an interested stockholder, and
thereafter unless specified criteria are met.  An interested stockholder is generally a person owning or controlling,
directly or indirectly, 10 percent or more of the voting power of the outstanding stock of the Maryland corporation.

The Maryland Control Share Acquisition Act provides that "control shares" of a corporation acquired in a "control
share acquisition" shall have no voting rights except to the extent approved by a vote of two-thirds of the votes
eligible to cast on the matter.  "Control Shares" means shares of stock that, if aggregated with all other shares of stock
previously acquired by the acquirer, would entitle the acquirer to exercise voting power in electing directors within
one of the following ranges of the voting power:  one-tenth or more but less than one-third, one-third or more but less
than a majority, or a majority or more of all voting power.  A "control share acquisition" means the acquisition of
control shares, subject to certain exceptions.

If voting rights of control shares acquired in a control share acquisition are not approved at a stockholders' meeting,
then subject to certain conditions and limitations, the issuer may redeem any or all of the control shares for fair
value.  If voting rights of such control shares are approved at a stockholders' meeting and the acquirer becomes
entitled to vote a majority of the shares of stock entitled to vote, all other stockholders may exercise appraisal rights.

ITEM 1B.  UNRESOLVED STAFF COMMENTS.

None.

ITEM 2.  PROPERTIES.

EastGroup owned 295 industrial properties and one office building at December 31, 2013.  These properties are
located primarily in the Sunbelt states of Florida, Texas, Arizona, California and North Carolina, and the majority are
clustered around major transportation features in supply constrained submarkets.  As of February 13, 2014,
EastGroup’s portfolio was 95.7% leased and 94.7% occupied.  The Company has developed approximately 34% of its
total portfolio (on a square foot basis), including real estate properties and development properties in lease-up and
under construction.  The Company’s focus is the ownership of business distribution space (79% of the total portfolio)
with the remainder in bulk distribution space (16%) and business service space (5%).  Business distribution space
properties are typically multi-tenant buildings with a building depth of 200 feet or less, clear height of 20-24 feet,
office finish of 10-25% and truck courts with a depth of 100-120 feet.  See Consolidated Financial Statement Schedule
III – Real Estate Properties and Accumulated Depreciation for a detailed listing of the Company’s properties.

At December 31, 2013, EastGroup did not own any single property with a book value that was 10% or more of total
book value or with gross revenues that were 10% or more of total gross revenues.
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The Company's lease expirations, excluding month-to-month leases of 267,000 square feet, for the next ten years are
detailed below:

Years Ending
December 31,

Number of Leases
Expiring

Total Area of Leases
Expiring
(in Square Feet)

Annualized Current
Base Rent of Leases
Expiring (1)

% of Total Base Rent of
Leases Expiring

2014 273 3,665,000 $19,583,000 12.5%
2015 310 6,591,000 $34,482,000 22.0%
2016 293 6,037,000 $29,660,000 18.9%
2017 162 4,501,000 $24,826,000 15.8%
2018 152 3,518,000 $18,477,000 11.8%
2019 56 1,725,000 $7,769,000 5.0%
2020 38 1,372,000
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